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Square 9 Announces New Solution, Return to Work Essentials, to Help 

Organizations Reopen Safely 
Helping Businesses Reopen Their Workplace Safely and Securely Through a Touchless 

Screening Process 

 
NEW HAVEN, CONN., July 23, 2020 - Square 9 Softworks®, a leading developer of award-winning 
enterprise content management solutions, has announced its release of Return to Work Essentials. 
This cloud-hosted solution helps facilitate the reopening process for organizations, ensuring they 
take the right measures to maintain a healthy and safe workplace.  

Developed as a touchless solution to screen employees, customers, or visitors before entering the 
workplace, Return to Work Essentials supports organizations during the COVID-19 pandemic to 
help limit the spread of infection. Through a few simple steps, anyone entering a workplace will be 
screened to ensure their health status before gaining access to the facility. 

“Now more than ever, many businesses need help returning to work and defining what that 
framework will look like,” said Stephen Young, CEO of Square 9 Softworks. “Our goal was to create 
a solution that would not just facilitate our office reopening, but others as well. With Return to Work 
Essentials, we have created a solution that solves a critical need for businesses and provides them 
with the confidence to reopen,” said Young.  

Return to Work Essentials goes beyond a simple temperature reading by requiring health screening 
information from visitors, protecting the business with a liability waiver, and securely collecting and 
reporting on transmission tracing data in a HIPAA compliant cloud repository.   

With the release of Return to Work Essentials, Square 9 remains committed to user feedback, 
demonstrating their continued commitment to customer innovation. For more information, please 
visit: https://info.square-9.com/return-to-work-essentials-reopen 

About Square 9 Softworks 
As a trendsetting software development firm, Square 9 is a creative force in the next generation of 
both on-premise and cloud-enabled Content Management solutions. Intensely customer-focused 
and highly responsive, Square 9 delivers effective, value-driven solutions and has achieved a 
reputation for excellence in meeting the rapidly evolving needs of its customers. In addition to 
GlobalSearch®, the award-winning Content Management solution platform, Square 9 has been 
widely recognized for its diverse portfolio of products including solutions for Document Capture 
Automation, Business Process Automation, and Web Forms Management. Square 9 Softworks 
distributes its solutions internationally through a network of highly skilled Channel Resellers from its 
corporate office in New Haven, Connecticut. www.square-9.com. 
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